PALL SPERA

COMPANY Caroline Marhefka <caroline.marhefka@pallspera.com>

REALTORS, LLC

Fwd: Wire Transfer Confirmation
1 message

Peggy Smith <peggy@stowere.com>
To: Caroline Marhefka <caroline.marhefka@pallspera.com>

Peggy Smith

Coldwell Banker Carlson Real Estate
Smith Macdonald Real Estate Group
www.smithmacdonaldrealestategroup
peggy@stowere.com

802 793-3566

| am no longer using AOL. Please use peggy@stowere.com

The Vermont Real Estate Commission requires all real estate agents to provide a Vermont Real Estate Consumer Disclosure to prospective purchasers and sellers. This disclosure outlines agency rt
any confidential information, you will be asked to confirm and acknowledge that you have received and understand this disclosure. The Disclosure form is not a contract. Our firm practices Designated Ag
licensees within the same firm.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Vanessa Knight <vanessa@carlsonrealestatestowe.com>
Subject: Wire Transfer Confirmation

Date: January 19, 2018 at 12:40:43 PM EST

To: Peggy Smith <peggy@stowere.com>

1/19/2018

To Whom It May Concern,
Coldwell Banker Carlson Real Estate received a wire transfer from Jason Cone on 1/16/2017 in the amount of $1,000.
Confirmation:

Wire Transfer

Credit CONE JASON
PETER/CONE BETHANN 6
WOODGROVE DRIVE WOODGROVE
CONDOMINIUM 04-20
SINGAPORE 7 DBS BANK

LTD 6 SHENTON WAY

DBS BUILDING, TOWER

ONE SINGAPORE 068809
FROM JASON CONE FOR
EARNEST DE FOR HIGH

HILLS CONDO
20180116G1B76E2C001380
20180116QMGFNP69000483
01160740FT01

01/16/2018

Please let me know if need any additional information.

Vanessa Kr\igl'lt

OF}Cicc Managcr

Coldwell Banker Carlson Real I state
802-253-7358



